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TraceLink Announces
FutureLink Nashville in October
2019

TraceLink Inc., the world’s largest integrated digital supply network providing real-
time information sharing for better patient outcomes, today announced its second
FutureLink event this year, to be held in Nashville from October 2-4, 2019.  

For a limited time, past FutureLink attendees are eligible to receive 50 percent off
full price registration for FutureLink Nashville, if they register before April 30, 2019.

FutureLink is the industry’s only event that gathers hundreds of leaders from
across the life sciences to collaborate on creating digital supply network solutions.
TraceLink hosts two annual FutureLink events, one in the U.S. and one in Europe,
to provide global and regional perspectives on the evolving pharmaceutical supply
chain.  At FutureLink Nashville in October, sessions and panels will offer insights on
topics including Drug Supply Chain Security Act (DSCSA) 2019, 2020 and 2023,
discuss the next wave of global track and trace requirements, and explore future
solutions as part of the digital supply network, including digital health, smart
supply and logistics, analytics, and supplier collaboration.

“As we enter the next phase of DSCSA where saleable returns, verification, and
blockchain are top of mind for many U.S. companies, FutureLink Nashville will
continue to be the industry’s only cross-supply chain forum that provides insights
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on the latest compliance updates, while driving conversation around the
opportunities achieved through end-to-end digitalization,” said Shabbir Dahod,
president and CEO, TraceLink. “FutureLink Nashville will focus on bringing
companies across the industry together to collaborate on solutions that will
revolutionize the industry and enable increased product safety, a more efficient
supply chain, and ultimately, yield better patient outcomes.”

To register for FutureLink Nashville, and learn more about the event, please
visit: https://www.tracelink.com/futurelink-nashville/about.
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