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TraceLink's Pune India Office
Expands and Relocates to
Amar Madhuban Tech Park

In a major growth milestone for TraceLink, the global leader in life sciences,
pharmaceutical, and healthcare supply chain solutions, the company has expanded
and relocated its Pune, India office to the prestigious Amar Madhuban Tech Park.
The decision to move to this state-of-the-art location comes as a strategic
investment to accommodate the company's rapidly growing workforce and
demonstrates TraceLink's commitment to delivering cutting-edge solutions to meet
the ever-evolving needs of its customers and the global Healthcare and Life
Sciences supply chain at large.

A Growing Workforce and Customer-Centric Approach

In recent years, TraceLink has experienced remarkable growth due to the
escalating demand for its comprehensive digital supply network and
multienterprise supply chain solutions. Within the past 3 years, our workforce in
Pune has nearly tripled, reflecting our commitment to meet the increasing needs of
our valued customers. The expansion of our Pune office not only serves as a
testament to our company's success but also underscores our unwavering
dedication to providing unparalleled support and services.

With the strategic relocation to Amar Madhuban Tech Park, TraceLink aims to
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cultivate a dynamic and innovative environment for our workforce, empowering us
to deliver top-notch solutions to clients worldwide with even greater efficiency and
expertise.

 

Amar Madhuban Tech Park: A Hub of Innovation

Situated in the heart of Pune's bustling tech district, Amar Madhuban Tech Park is
renowned for its modern infrastructure and cutting-edge facilities. The park boasts
an impressive array of amenities, including high-speed internet connectivity,
spacious workspaces, and well-designed recreational areas that promote employee
well-being. With its strategic location and state-of-the-art setup, the park aligns
perfectly with TraceLink's vision of creating a world-class workspace that inspires
creativity and fosters collaboration among its employees.

Empowering the Supply Chain of the Future

As the global supply chain industry faces unprecedented challenges, TraceLink
remains at the forefront of providing innovative solutions to address these
complexities. The new Pune office will play a crucial role in driving TraceLink's
mission to empower businesses of all sizes with the tools and insights they need to
optimize their supply chain processes.
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From TraceLink's CEO, Shabbir Dahod

"We are thrilled to announce the expansion and relocation of our Pune India office
to the Amar Madhuban Tech Park. This move not only highlights our commitment
to nurturing a talented workforce but also signifies our dedication to delivering
world-class supply chain solutions to our esteemed customers. With this state-of-
the-art facility, we are confident in our ability to scale new heights and lead the
way in revolutionizing the global supply chain industry."

 

Final Thoughts

As TraceLink's Pune India office completes its relocation to the Amar Madhuban
Tech Park, the company is poised to embark on an exciting new chapter in its
journey. With a growing workforce across all of its offices around the globe and a
continued focus on customer-centricity, TraceLink remains steadfast in its mission
to deliver innovative supply chain solutions that drive success for businesses
worldwide. The move to this cutting-edge facility solidifies TraceLink's position as a
leader in the industry and reinforces its commitment to shaping the supply chain of
the future.

Subscribe to Agile Supply Chain Insights
Stay informed with the latest patient-centric agile supply chain thought leadership content.
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